RFP SUMMARY
Fontana Unified School District
RFP No. 24/25-0008 Purchase and Delivery of Raw Meat

Bid Item Estimated Annual

# Product Description Unit Specified Quantity UOM  Unit Price Extended Price
1 Chicken, Boneless Thighs, Organic (refrigerated) 40 LB 150 Cs $397.10 $ 59,565.00
2 Chicken, Boneless Thighs, Non-Organic (refrigerated) 40 LB 150 CS NO BID NO BID
3 Drumsticks, Organic (refrigerated) 8/2LB 300 CS $61.47 $18,441.00
4 Drumsticks, Non-Organic (refrigerated) 8/2LB 300 CS NO BID NO BID
5  Drumsticks, Organic (frozen) 8/2LB 300 CS $61.47 $ 18,441.00
6 Drumsticks, Non-Organic (frozen) 8/2LB 300 CS NO BID NO BID
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RFP SUMMARY
Fontana Unified School District

RFP No. 24/25-0008 Purchase and Delivery of Raw Meat

MARIN SUN FARMS INC.

Bid Item Estimated Annual

# Product Description Unit Specified Quantity UOM | Unit Price | Extended Price
26 Pork, Shoulder Whole, Boneless (refrigerated) 30LB 150 CS $ 165.90 $ 24,885.00
27  Pork, Stew Meat, 1-1.5" Cut (refrigerated) 10/4 LB 150 CS NO BID NO BID
28  Pork, Stew Meat, 1-1.5" Cut (frozen) 10/4 LB 150 CS $189.90 $ 28,485.00
29  Pork, Diced, 1/2" Cut (refrigerated) 10/4 LB 150 CS NO BID NO BID
30  Pork, Diced, 1/2" Cut (frozen) 10/4 LB 150 CS $ 189.90 $ 28,485.00
31  Chicken Bones: Backs/Bones/Miscellaneous (frozen) 40 LB 5 o $103.90 $519.50
32  Duck Breast, Skin-On (refrigerated) 12/PIECES 7 PACK NOBID NO BID
33 Beef Short Ribs Chuck, Boneless (refrigerated) 40 LB 10 CS $ 399.50 $ 3,995.00
34  Beef Skirt Steak, Inside Peeled (refrigerated) 40 LB 10 CS $519.50 $5,195.00
35  Beef New York Steak, Boneless (refrigerated) 10.5LB 15 CS $ 157.61 $2,364.15
36  Beef Filet Mignon (refrigerated) 10.5LB 15 CS $190.16 $2,852.40
37  Beef Tri Tip (refrigerated) 10.5LB 10 CS $157.61 $1,576.10
38  Pork Loin Chops, Bone-In (refrigerated) 20LB 10 CS
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